
House of Night Series: Marked, Betrayed,
Chosen, and Untamed
The House of Night series is a captivating young adult fantasy series written by
P.C. Cast and her daughter Kristin Cast. This article will delve into the first four
books of the series: Marked, Betrayed, Chosen, and Untamed. Prepare yourself
to be transported into the enchanting world of vampires, magic, and teenage
drama!

Marked: A Journey into the Unknown

In the first book of the series, Marked, we are introduced to Zoey Redbird, a
sixteen-year-old girl who is about to go through a life-altering transformation. After
being marked as a vampire, she is forced to leave her old life behind and attend
the House of Night, a boarding school for fledgling vampires.

As Zoey tries to adapt to her new reality, she discovers that being marked is only
the beginning of her extraordinary journey. With the help of her new friends,
including the rebellious and mysterious Aphrodite, Zoey must navigate the
treacherous halls of the House of Night while also dealing with the potential
darkness lurking within her own soul.
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The first book sets the stage for an immersive and engaging series, blending
elements of magic, friendship, and self-discovery. Readers will find themselves
turning page after page, eager to uncover the secrets and challenges that lie
ahead for Zoey and her fellow fledglings.

Betrayed: Facing Shadows and Hidden Dangers

In the second installment, Betrayed, Zoey finds herself facing even greater
threats within the House of Night. A series of brutal murders shakes the vampire
community, and Zoey becomes determined to unravel the mystery behind them.

As the danger intensifies, Zoey's relationships with her friends and love interests
are put to the test. Betrayed explores themes of loyalty, trust, and sacrifice,
delving deeper into the complex dynamics of the House of Night and the bonds
formed between its inhabitants.

This book is a rollercoaster of emotions, filled with intense action sequences and
heart-wrenching moments. Readers will find themselves engrossed in Zoey's
quest for truth, hoping that she can navigate the darkness surrounding her
without losing herself along the way.

Chosen: A Battle between Good and Evil

The third book, Chosen, takes the House of Night series to new heights as Zoey
embraces her destiny as the chosen one and begins to harness her unique
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powers. She must face her greatest enemy yet, a powerful vampire who
threatens to destroy everything she holds dear.

As Zoey's circle of friends grows stronger, so does the impending war that looms
on the horizon. The stakes are higher than ever as she uncovers shocking
secrets and uncovers the true alliances within the vampire world.

Chosen is a page-turner that will leave readers breathless, yearning for more as
they witness Zoey's evolution from an unsure fledgling to a formidable leader,
determined to protect her loved ones.

Untamed: Unleashing the Power Within

The fourth installment, Untamed, picks up where Chosen left off, exploring the
consequences of Zoey's actions and the aftermath of the war that took place. The
bond between Zoey and her friends is tested, and she must confront the
darkness within herself.

This book delves into themes of redemption, forgiveness, and self-acceptance as
Zoey grapples with the choices she's made and the sacrifices she's endured. The
House of Night world expands even further as new alliances are formed and old
ones are shattered.

Untamed is an emotionally charged book that will leave readers on the edge of
their seats, eagerly anticipating the next installment in the series.

The House of Night series, with its thrilling plotlines and well-developed
characters, is a must-read for fans of young adult fantasy. Marked, Betrayed,
Chosen, and Untamed lay the foundation for an epic journey filled with twists,
turns, and unexpected revelations.



If you're ready to lose yourself in a world of vampires, magic, and teenage drama,
then dive into the House of Night series and join Zoey Redbird on her quest to
fulfill her destiny and protect those she loves.

Remember, the journey has just begun; you won't want to miss what comes next
in this compelling series!
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Dare to enter the House of Night, the phenomenal #1 New York Times bestselling
young adult series from P.C. Cast and Kristin Cast, with this all new e-original
collection of the first four books, including Marked, Betrayed, Chosen and
Untamed
Marked
Zoey enters the House of Night, a school where, after having undergone the
Change, she will train to become an adult vampire--that is, if she makes it through
the Change. Not all of those who are chosen do. It's tough to begin a new life,
away from her parents and friends, and on top of that, Zoey finds she is no
average fledgling.
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Betrayed
Fledgling vampyre Zoey Redbird has managed to settle in at the House of Night.
She's come to terms with the vast powers the vampyre goddess, Nyx, has given
her, and is getting a handle on being the new Leader of the Dark Daughters. Best
of all, Zoey finally feels like she belongs--like she really fits in. She actually has a
boyfriend…or two. Then the unthinkable happens: Human teenagers are being
killed, and all the evidence points to the House of Night.

Chosen
Dark forces are at work at the House of Night and fledgling vampyre Zoey
Redbird's adventures at the school take a mysterious turn. Those who appear to
be friends are turning out to be enemies. And oddly enough, sworn enemies are
also turning into friends. So begins the gripping third installment of this "highly
addictive series" (Romantic Times),in which Zoey's mettle will be tested like never
before.

Untamed
Life sucks when your friends are pissed at you. Just ask Zoey Redbird – she's
become an expert on suckiness. In one week she has gone from having three
boyfriends to having none, and from having a close group of friends who trusted
and supported her, to being an outcast. Speaking of friends, the only two Zoey
has left are undead and unMarked. And Neferet has declared war on humans,
which Zoey knows in her heart is wrong. But will anyone listen to her?
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